
St Jude the Apostle – Willington                                               Feast of Christ the King                                                                             Sunday 22nd November   

Parish Office open Monday to Friday 9.30am to 12.30pm Email judesparishoffice@eircom.net   www.stjudesparish.net  

Recently Deceased 
† 

Eva Kelly  

Pat Crowley 

Geoffrey Hartnett 

Anastasia Stokes 

John Crowley  

Cathal Duffy  

† 

Anniversaries 

† 

Ann Barry  

Members of the McNamee 

Family  

Samuel & Margaret Tonge 

Patrick Carr 

Josephine Wickham 

John & Mary Egan  

Nora & John Kavanagh 

Paddy & Mary Kenny  

Joseph Lynch  

Jim Byrne  

Pat Mc Hugh  

Mary Cooke 

Tom Bowe 

Nonie Daly 

Tom Moloney  

Kathleen O’Brien  

Mary Connolly  

James Mc Nally 

Amy Whelan 

Áine & Noreen Kavanagh 

George Magee 

Christopher & Emily 

McDermott 

John Christopher Sheehan 

James & Peter Healy  

Kathleen Fox  
 

May they rest in peace. 
  

Financial News 
Share €1050 
House to House €1355 
 

 

Dublin Simon Community 
Annual Appeal 21st/22nd 

November  
This Sundays Church Gate 
Collection will be in Aid of the 
Dublin Simon Community. For 40 
years Dublin Simon has been 
trying to break the cycle of 
homelessness, helping out people 
who are in danger or experiencing 
homelessness. 
 
 
DATES FOR YOUR DIARY  
___________________________ 

The Dublin Symphony 

Orchestra, under the baton 

of their permanent 

conductor Fergus O’Carroll 

will perform a concert of 

classical music on Sat Dec. 

5th at 8.pm. Full details of 

programme & tickets etc at 

a later date. 

___________________ 

St Vincent De Paul Annual 

Christmas Collection will 

take place at all masses on 

the weekend of 12th/13th 

December and will replace 

the normal share collection  

Toy Sunday will also take 

place on that weekend. 

 

 

 

 
Nice Range of Christmas 

Cards,Candles & Children’s 

Books now available in the 

Parish Office why not drop 

in  and have a look .  
 

Older & Bolder 
Older & Bolder is campaigning 
against a possible cut to older 
people’s State Pension in the 
December budget.  This is a time 
for action and for older people to 
make their voices heard in 
defence of vital supports and 
services that affect the quality of 
their lives.   
 
Older & Bolder is inviting old and 
young to sign either our online or 
postal petition in defence of the 
State Pension.  We are also 
asking you to spread the word 
and to involve friends, peers and 
groups in the collection of 
signatures for the petition during 
the month of November.  Over the 
last weekend of November 
27/28th – we are encouraging 
people to lobby their TDs on the 
urgency of protecting older 
people’s pensions and supports.  
Packs are available to people who 
want to get involved in the 
campaign.  Ring us on 01-
8783623  or email 
info@olderandbolder.ie. You can 
also download information from 
ourwebsite,  
www.olderandbolder.ie .. 
 

 

 

 

Ministers of the Eucharist  
Advent meeting will take 
place this Monday 23rd 

November at 8.pm in the 
Pastoral Centre  

ADVENT RETREAT 
“Stand with Confidence before the 

Son of Man”   in Orlagh Retreat 
Centre, Orlagh, Old Court Road, 

Dublin 16 

Tel: (01) 495 8193 Fax: (01) 493 
0987 E-mail: info@orlagh.ie 

 Led by 
Fr. John Byrne OSA, Dr. Kieran 

O’Mahony OSA, and Dr. 
Bernadette Toal 

6.00 pm Friday November 27  to 
2.00 pm November 29, 2009. 

€160 (residential) 
€110 (non-residential) 

 

The next Taize 
Mass  
will be 

celebrated here 
on Sunday 29

th
 November at 

7.30pm Celebrant Fr John 
Browne .Please use Rossmore 

Entrance  
There will also be a Taize Mass 
here each Sunday in Advent at 
7.30pm up to the 20

th
 December  

 

 
The Next Family Mass will be 

celebrated here on Sunday next 
29

th
 November (1

st
 Sunday in 

Advent ) at 12.00noon we 
especially welcome 
families with young 
children to come and 
join us at this Mass. 
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